
Health and Social Services (2016 Fees – Homes and Nursing) 

(Jersey) Order 2015 Article 1 

 

 ◊  Page - 1 

 
 

 
HEALTH AND SOCIAL SERVICES (2016 FEES – 

HOMES AND NURSING) (JERSEY) ORDER 2015 

Made   

Coming into force   

THE MINISTER FOR HEALTH AND SOCIAL SERVICES, in pursuance 

of Articles 2 and 6 of the Nursing Agencies (Jersey) Law 1978 and Articles 4 

and 15 of the Nursing and Residential Homes (Jersey) Law 1994, orders as 

follows – 

1 Nursing Agencies (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1978 amended  

In Article 2 of the Nursing Agencies (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1978 – 

(a) in paragraph (2) – 

(i) for the amount “£272.65” there is substituted the amount “£710”,  

(ii) for the amount “£134.66” there is substituted the amount “£361”; 

(b) in paragraph (3) for the amount “£107.08” there is substituted the amount 

“£200”. 

2 Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes (General Provisions) (Jersey) 

Order 1995 amended  

In the Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes (General Provisions) (Jersey) 

Order 1995 – 

(a) in Article 3 – 

(i) in paragraph (a) for the amount “£79.18” there is substituted the 

amount “£250”, 

(ii) in paragraph (b) for the amount “£186.96” there is substituted the 

amount “£710”; 

(b) in Article 4(1) for the amount “£95.48” there is substituted the amount 

“£361”. 

3 Residential Homes (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1995 amended  

In the Residential Homes (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1995 – 



Article 4 

Health and Social Services (2016 Fees – Homes and Nursing) 

(Jersey) Order 2015 

 

 
Page - 2  ◊  
 

(a) in Article 3 – 

(i) in paragraph (a) for the amount “£79.18” there is substituted the 

amount “£250”, 

(ii) in paragraph (b) for the amount “£186.96” there is substituted the 

amount “£710”; 

(b) in Article 4(1) for the amount “£95.48” there is substituted the amount 

“£361”. 

4 Citation and commencement  

This Order may be cited as the Health and Social Services (2016 Fees – Homes 

and Nursing) (Jersey) Order 2015 and comes into force 7 days after it is made. 

 

 

Signed.................................................................... 

Date........................................................................ 

Minister for Health and Social Services 

 

 
 



Health and Social Services (2016 Fees – Homes and Nursing) 

(Jersey) Order 2015 Endnotes 

 

 ◊  Page - 3 

 
 

 


	1 Nursing Agencies (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1978 amended
	2 Nursing Homes and Mental Nursing Homes (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1995 amended
	3 Residential Homes (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1995 amended
	4 Citation and commencement

